M Gma" Syafrul Yamani Safruddin <syafrul.gading@gmail.com>

Re: NEW LETTER OFFER, TERM AND CONDIDITON - 8366 MOHD AMIRUDDIN BIN
AZMI

1 message

Amiruddin Azmi <amiruddin.azmi89@yahoo.com> Wed, May 15, 2024 at 11:07 AM
To: Dian Noor Agiella Mohd Ashari <dian@galaxyaerospace.my>
Cc: "syafrul@galaxyaerospace.my" <syafrul@galaxyaerospace.my>

Dear management team,

As mentioned in previous email there are pending type rating allowance for the past 2 years and yet no action taken.This
issue should not happen since | joined GAM for urgent vacancy due to few type rating in my license which is beneficial to
the company

I would like to request for this new contract to revise my basic salary to RM 10000.00 to compensate for the pending
allowance and back dated.

Secondly, AS 350 B3 (Series) just added to my approval to be used for company benefit and again request another
RM2000.00 allowance for that particular type rating approval.

Thank you for your attention.

Best regards,
Mohd Amiruddin Azmi

On Friday, 5 April 2024 at 08:37:21 am GMT+8, Dian Noor Agiella Mohd Ashari <dian@galaxyaerospace.my> wrote:

Dear Mr. Amiruddin

We take note of your concerns. However, we would like to emphasize that we are not practicing salary
increments/revision upon contract renewal for the time being. Moreover, for AMO Departments, all employment packages,
salary, increments are strictly under HOD purview.

We understand and truly appreciate your contributions throughout your employment with us. You may refer or request
with your HOD for further considerations.

Thank you

Stay Safe and Have a nice day !!

Regards,

Dian Noor Agiella Mohd Ashari

HR Executive

for and on behalf of

GALAXY AEROSPACE (M) SDN BHD
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Suite 11-14, Helicopter Centre, Malaysia International Aerospace Centre,
Sultan Abdul Aziz Shah Airport, 47200 Subang, Selangor Darul Ehsan.
Website : www.galaxyaerospace.my


mailto:dian@galaxyaerospace.my
http://www.galaxyaerospace.my/

®+60377347226 7+60377347526

On Thu, 4 Apr 2024 at 23:49, Amiruddin Azmi <amiruddin.azmi89@yahoo.com> wrote:
Dear Sir/Mdm,

Regarding my new letter offer issued, an email sent to HR few weeks ago to highlight important issue for future
improvement.

Currently, | am still waiting for the feedback. Yesterday was my last day as per previous letter offer.

Please advise accordingly.

Thank you for your attention.

Best regards,

Amir

On Tuesday, 19 March 2024 at 06:41:30 am GMT+8, Amiruddin Azmi <amiruddin.azmi89@yahoo.com> wrote:
Dear Miss/Mdm,

Thank you for the new letter offer issued.

As per discussion prior to report duty on 4 April 2022,an allowance of RM 6000 agreed to be paid for my current 3 type
rating EXCLUDING AW 139.

Unfortunately, only 2 type rating allowance paid instead of 3.

As an employee, RM2000 per month for 2 years is huge and very important issue which affect the performance.
This issue remain silent without any action taken for nearly 2 years.

Hereby, | request the remaining allowance prior to begin the new contract.

Again for this new contract, | request basic salary adjustment after 2 years serve the company.

Best regards,

Amir

On Tuesday, 13 February 2024 at 06:32:07 pm GMT+8, Dian Noor Agiella Mohd Ashari <dian@galaxyaerospace.my>
wrote:

Dear Mr.Amiruddin

Congratulations! Galaxy Aerospace (M) Sdn Bhd is pleased to renew your offer as a LAE position.

Enclosed please find attached is your complete NEW LETTER OFFER with GAM effective 06 April 2024. Please
forward this offer letter that has been signed as soon as possible to us as acceptances.

For your information, the cooling-off period between 04 April 2024 until 05 April 2024 will be paid in cash/credited
whether you are on Leave or coming to work as usual.

In addition, kindly update the employee details and supporting documents in GAMS Portal.
If you have any questions, do not hesitate to contact us. Please feel free to contact us if you have any queries.

Thank you and have a great day ahead.
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Stay Safe and Have a nice day !!

Regards,

Dian Noor Agiella Mohd Ashari

HR Executive

for and on behalf of

GALAXY AEROSPACE (M) SDN BHD
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Website : www.galaxyaerospace.my
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