11/15/23, 11:45 AM Gmail - FIRE EXTINGUISHER CERTIFICATE RENEWAL
N' Gmail Mohd Saiful Hasanun <mohdsaiful.gam@gmail.com>

FIRE EXTINGUISHER CERTIFICATE RENEWAL

2 messages

Syed Mohd Rastam Jamalulail Syed lkmal Hashim <rastam@galaxyaerospace.my> Tue. Rov'13: 2023t 3,;,3
To: "firsafe2009@gmail.com" <firsafe2009@gmail.com>

Cc: Mohd Saiful Hasanun <saiful@galaxyaerospace.my>, Mohamad Akmal M Saleh
<akmalsaleh@galaxyaerospace.my>, Safety Department <safety@galaxyaerospace.my>

Dear Mr. Steven.
Hope this email finds you well.

I'm from Galaxy Aerospace (M) Sdn Bhd. | would like to ask for you to quote us for 4 units of fire extinguishers that
need to be sent for servicing and renewal.

Details as below:

1. UF072022Y402570 - Due 18 Aug 2023
2. UF072022Y402891 - Due 18 Aug 2023
3. UF032018Y400973 - Due 18 Aug 2023
4. UF072022Y402421 - Due 18 Aug 2023

Location:

Agensi Penguatkuasa Maritime Malaysia.
Jalan TUDM Tentera Udara Diraja Subang,
40150 Shah Alam,

Selangor.

(Need to be escort)

Please do not hesitate to contact me via mobile at 0143475725 or through this email for any queries needed.
Thank you,

Kind Regards,
Syed Mohd Rastam Jamalolail Syed Ikmal Hashim
Safety
for and on behalf of
GALAXY AEROSPACE (M) SDN BHD
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GalaxyAerospacs

Lot 11-14, MRO Centre, Malaysia International Acrospace Centre,
Sultan Abdul Aziz Shah Airport, 47200 Subang, Selangor Darul Ehsan.
Website : www.galaxyaerospace.my

8 160377347226 2+60377347526

Syed Mohd Rastam Jamalulail Syed Ikmal Hashim <rastam@galaxyaerospace.my> Vi, hov 15, 200 &t gfra

To: afigalwadud.galaxyaerospace@gmail.com

Cc: Badrulzaman Aminuddin <badrulzaman@galaxyaerospace.my>, Mohd Saiful Hasanun
<saiful@galaxyaerospace.my>, Mohamad Akmal M Saleh <akmalsaleh@galaxyaerospace.my>, Nurulazhan Sallehuddin
<azhan@galaxyaerospace.my>, Wan |zahan Zameree Ishak <izahan@galaxyaerospace.my>,
hafizulhilmi.galaxy@gmail.com, Finance Department <finance@galaxyaerospace.my>, Safety Department
<safety@galaxyaerospace.my>

Dear En. Afig.
We have 4 unit Fire Extinguishers that need to be sent for servicing.

Please find the quotation attached for your kind perusal.

https:/imail.google.com/mail/u/0/?71k=98989f8461 &view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f. 1782522886358 1 28475&simpl=msg-f:1782522886358... 112



11/15/23, 11:45 AM Gmail - FIRE EXTINGUISHER CERTIFICATE RENEWAL

Thank you.

Kind Regards,

Syed Mohd Rastam Jamalolail Syed Ikmal Hashim
Safety

for and on behalf of

GALAXY AEROSPACE (M) SDN BHD

Sl

T

GalaxyAerospace

Lot 11-14, MRO Centre, Malaysia International Aerospace Centre,
Sultan Abdul Aziz Shah Airport, 47200 Subang, Selangor Darul Ehsan.
Website : www.galaxyaerospace.my

&8 160377347226 2+60377347526

---------- Forwarded message =--------

From: Firsafe Enterprise <firsafe2009@gmail.com>

Date: Wed, 15 Nov 2023 at 09:19

Subject: Re: FIRE EXTINGUISHER CERTIFICATE RENEWAL

To: Syed Mohd Rastam Jamalulail Syed Ikmal Hashim <rastam@galaxyaerospace.my=>

Quotation
[Quoted text hidden]

Dear All,.
Good Days.

Thanks & Regards,

FIRSAFE ENTERPRISE

No 22 Jalan 4/154D,Taman Desa Cheras,
56000, Kuala Lumpur.

Tel/lFax: 03-9108 3063

email: firsafe2009@gmail.com
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FIRSAFE ENTERPRISE Z£8—1{

( A Member Of K K Group) PKK Lesen No.: 1404W20020412

No 22 Jalan 4/154D,Taman Desa Cheras. 56000.k.1.

tel/fax: 03-2108 3063 email: firsafe2009@gmail.com
Quotation
Galaxy Aerospace (M ) Sdn. Bhd.
Lot 11-14 MRO Centre Malaysia International
Aerospace Centre, Sultan Abdul Aziz Shah Airport .Subang . REF: 7329
Tel: 03- Fax: 03- DATE: 15 023
ATT: Cik Rastam S.PERSON: Steven
NO | UNIT DESCRIPTION U/PRICE AMOUNT
a) Service & Checking Fire Extinguisher
4 |9 Kg ABC Dry Powder Chemical RM40.00 RM160.00
b) 4 BOMBA Approval Certificate RM 5.00 RM20.00
TOTAL : RM180.00
* Delivery time: - Approximately 3-5 working days from approval date. Comfirmatiom
* Payment : C.0.D
Company Bank Details :
Bank : Public Bank Berhad
A/C No : 3159145307
Steven
Prepare By Chop & Sign
Steven I/We, hereby confirm and accept the
Outdoor Sales Team Manager above terms and conditions
H/P: 012 - 2979813 Name:

Date:




