M Gma" Mohd Al Hafiz <syntheticx2@gmail.com>

RFQ Sunavionics AV-15 Portable Ramp Tester

Sun Avionics <sales@sunavionics.com> Wed, Jun 7, 2017 at 11:26 PM
Reply-To: Sun Avionics <sales@sunavionics.com>

To: "Mohd Al Hafiz (Bob)" <bob@galaxyaerospace.my>

Cc: Hazrin Sani <sales@galaxyaerospace.my>, "Mr. Shamsul Kamar Samsudin" <sam@galaxyaerospace.my>

Hi Bob,

| appreciate the update. | have attached a Pro Forma invoice and our banking information. There is no charge from us to do a
bank wire, however, please be sure to take your own bank fees out of the transfer. We will be expecting $1,720.00. Please
send a payment confirmation once completed so | can ship the order. Please let me know if you have any questions.

Thank you and | look forward to your reply.
Sincerely,

Deanna Jeffery
Sun Avionics Inc.
1845 Shepard Drive
Titusville, FL 32780
United States

Phone: 321-383-9488
Email: sales@sunavionics.com
Web: www.sunavionics.com

————— Original Message ——-
From: Mohd Al Hafiz (Bob)
To: Sun Avionics

[Quoted text hidden]

2 attachments

ﬂ WIRE TRANSFER INFORMATION-SAI.pdf
50K

E Pro Forma Invoice SAI17-1287.pdf
44K
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