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Print Date : Jan-30-2024 10:39 AM Printed By : ST5 Print No. 1:

Your Ref
Terms
Our Contact

Our Ref

For : Account No. [7526]

GALAXY AEROSPACE(M)SDN BHD
Attn: NUR SYAMIN SYUHADA AMDAN
SUITE 11-14 HELICOPTER CENTER
MALAYSIA INTERNATIONAL AEROSPACE CENTRE
SULTAN ABDUL AZIZSHAH AIRPORT

MALAYSIA
SUBANG SELANGOR 47200

Tel. : +60 377347226
Fax : +60 37734526

:
No. 057650

Q057650
TWO 26 240/SUPERLYNX:
PAYMENT IN ADVANCE:

:Yukine Okada

Valid Until : Feb-29-2024

In response to your request, we are pleased to quote you the following:

Pg

F.O.B. : CHRISTCHURCH, NZ
Quote Date : Jan-30-2024

eMail : yukine@customaero.co.nz

:1/3

P/N & Description Qty Bid Delivery Unit Price AmountCnLine

NO BID.NAS1291C4M01
NUT

NO BID.M82348/1-02402
O-RING

$ 600.00EA$ 60.007 DaysEA10NEWSMB0088-10103
BEARING

W/OUR C OF C ONLYTag Info: 
$ 39,600.00EA$ 4,950.0045 DaysEA8NEEA2600V037-00404

GREY CARTRIDGE
W/OUR C OF C ONLYTag Info: 

$ 900.00EA$ 90.007 DaysEA10NEWG1369-0026-10105
BOLT

W/OUR C OF C ONLYTag Info: 
NO BID.AN4-3606

BOLT

NO BID.2600-507
STUD

NO BID.L22541-040N08
NUT

$ 1,200.00EA$ 400.007 DaysEA3NEWG0069-0121-10109
CAP

W/OUR C OF C ONLYTag Info: 
NO BID.2600-610

STUD ASSY

Continued on next page...

NOTES:

**QTY SENSITIVE LESSER QTY NEED TO REQUOTE WITH DIFFERENT PRICING**

ALL ABOVE ITEMS ARE SUBJECT TO PRIOR SALE

QUOTE IS VALID FOR 30 DAYS UNLESS SPECIFIED

ALL ITEMS WILL COME WITH OUR COMPANY'S CERTIFICATE OF COMPLIANCE 

OUR MINIMUM ORDER USD100 FOR EACH LINE

Ser #:[2000.20113] Ver 9.00.03 Build 32
Copyright (c) FORM (2008-2)/REV (A)  MAY 1, 2008PENTAGON2000 Software, Inc.
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Our Ref :2/3

P/N & Description Qty Bid Delivery Unit Price AmountCnLine

$ 33,150.00EA$ 1,950.0045 DaysEA17NEDSR4629-100311
BEARING

W/OUR C OF C ONLYTag Info: 
$ 2,040.00EA$ 102.007 DaysEA20NEWG0039-0118-10112

NUT
W/OUR C OF C ONLYTag Info: 

$ 44,800.00EA$ 11,200.0030 DaysEA4NEWG1369-2370-04113
TIE-BAR ASSEMBLY

W/OUR C OF C ONLYTag Info: 
$ 14,240.00EA$ 890.007 DaysEA16NEWG1369-2337-10314

BOLT
W/OUR C OF C ONLYTag Info: 

$ 21,200.00EA$ 21,200.0045 DaysEA1NEWG1368-0060-04115
FLANGE, DRIVE

W/OUR C OF C ONLYTag Info: 
NO BID.L22719-50-26BCL16

PIN

NO BID.L22453-60AGL17
NUT

NO BID.MDS0028D05-0318
BOLT

NO BID.WG1369-0092-10119
WASHER

NO BID.100-907-110920
O-RING

NO BID.LN29957-05-008A21
BOLT

NO BID.NMCSB8000UGM56T22
SPACER STAND OFF

NO BID.LN65005A0400623
SCREW

NO BID.100-216-007324
O-RING

NO BID.D38999-26JE35SN25

Continued on next page...

NOTES:

**QTY SENSITIVE LESSER QTY NEED TO REQUOTE WITH DIFFERENT PRICING**

ALL ABOVE ITEMS ARE SUBJECT TO PRIOR SALE

QUOTE IS VALID FOR 30 DAYS UNLESS SPECIFIED

ALL ITEMS WILL COME WITH OUR COMPANY'S CERTIFICATE OF COMPLIANCE 

OUR MINIMUM ORDER USD100 FOR EACH LINE

Ser #:[2000.20113] Ver 9.00.03 Build 32
Copyright (c) FORM (2008-2)/REV (A)  MAY 1, 2008PENTAGON2000 Software, Inc.
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Our Ref :3/3

P/N & Description Qty Bid Delivery Unit Price AmountCnLine

ELECTRICAL CONNECTOR

NO BID.WG0069-0072-10326
BUSHING SLEEVE

NO BID.WG0069-0087-10127
WASHER

NO BID.WG0069-0130-10128
SPACER RING

NO BID.LN29784-04X429
SCREW

NO BID.M81969/14-0130
INSERTION/REMOVAL

Sue Kim, 

Sub Total: $ 157,730.00

Total: [USD] $ 157,730.00

NOTES:

**QTY SENSITIVE LESSER QTY NEED TO REQUOTE WITH DIFFERENT PRICING**

ALL ABOVE ITEMS ARE SUBJECT TO PRIOR SALE

QUOTE IS VALID FOR 30 DAYS UNLESS SPECIFIED

ALL ITEMS WILL COME WITH OUR COMPANY'S CERTIFICATE OF COMPLIANCE 

OUR MINIMUM ORDER USD100 FOR EACH LINE

Ser #:[2000.20113] Ver 9.00.03 Build 32
Copyright (c) FORM (2008-2)/REV (A)  MAY 1, 2008PENTAGON2000 Software, Inc.


