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INDUSTRIES Inc. Tel: (770) 632-1851 Fax: (770) 632-1852

Aiming for Blue Skies www.primeindustriesusa.com
FEIN 65-1020927

QUOTATION
IPrint Date : May-23-2022 5:00 PM Printed By : Marc Lacourly PrintNo.: 1
For : Account No. [GALAXY] No. 117273 Pg:1/9
GALAXY AEROSPACE (M) SDN BHD Our Ref :117273-ML
Attn: Muhammad Khalish Nazli Terms :NET-30 DAYS
SUITE 11-14, HELICOPTER CENTER Our Contact ~ :NICOLE PHILLIPS
MALAYSIA INTERNATIONAL AEROSPACE CENTRE Valid Until : Jun-22-2022
SULTAN ABDUL AZIZ SHAH AIRPORT F.0.B. :EX-WORKS
SELANGOR, SUBANG 47200 Quote Date : May-23-2022
MALAYSIA

Tel.: 011 603 7887 0426
Fax : 011 603 7887 0526

In response to your request, we are pleased to quote you the following:

Line P/N & Description Cnd Qty Bid Delivery Unit Price Amount

01  |365A25-8200-02 | NO BID
EQUIPPED LOCKING PIN
MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS

02 365A25-8096-31 FN 1EA 180 Days $200.00000 EA $200.00
SHIM, LEFT FRICTION
MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS

03 365A25-8200-25 FN 2 EA 180 Days $85.00000 EA $170.00
LOCKING PIN SPRING
MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS

04 365A25-8168-20 | NO BID
FINGER LOCKING DOOR
05 23310CA010012 FN 100 EA 15 Days $0.25000 EA $25.00
* Quantity is greater than requested (1) *
COTTER PIN
06 365A25-8096-12 FN 2 EA Stock $325.00000 EA $650.00

ROLLER,EQUIPPED
MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS

07 365A25-8096-53 FN 2 EA Stock $ 245.00000 EA $490.00
CAP
MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS

08 365A25-8096-26 FN NO BID

SHIM, LEFT FRICTION
MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS

1. Prime Industries' Standard Terms & Conditions of Sale apply. Delivery is quoted in Business Days only,

2. Prices & deliveries herein quoted are applicable to the quantities as covered by this quotation.

3. All materials quoted from stock or with deliveries of 15 days or less are subject to prior sale.

4. In the event of an order, the above commaodities are not to be shipped to any country that has an embargo
placed against it by the U.S. Government. Should these commaodities require an export license, it shall be .
your responsibilty to comply with the United States Department of State/Commerce Export Regulations. Continued on next page...

5. If an Export License is required, a $250.00 processing fee will apply for each occurrence

6. Hazardous Material (HAZMAT) Shipments shall be subject to a minimum Haz-Mat handling fee of $250.00 per package.

FN=Factory New/NS=New Surplus/OH=Overhaul Certified/SV=Serviceable/RP=Repaired/AR=As Removed

Copyright (c) PENTAGON 2000 Software, Inc.
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Line P/N & Description Cnd Qty Bid Delivery Unit Price Amount
09 21217DC3214J FN 100 EA 15 Days $0.30000 EA $30.00
* Quantity is greater than requested (2 ) *
RIVET
10 21217DC3212J FN 100 EA 15 Days $0.40000 EA $40.00
* Quantity is greater than requested (2 ) *
RIVET
11 365A25-8144-15 FN 2 EA Stock $1,650.00000 EA $3,300.00
ROLLER
MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS
12 365A25-8143-29 FN 2EA Stock $125.00000 EA $250.00
ROLL ASSY LOWER
MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS
13 ASN52320BH050N | NO BID
NUT
I/W: 5PH135M
14 332A22-1325-01 FN 1EA Stock $695.00000 EA $695.00
ROLLER
MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS
15 | 171601791l FN 1EA  |15Days $350.00000 EA $350.00
SEAL LIP
16 171601816H FN 1EA 15 Days $625.00000 EA $625.00
SEALING RING
17 171601815G FN 1EA 15 Days $625.00000 EA $625.00
SEALING RING
18 365A08-8639-09 FN 1EA Stock $6,500.00000 EA $6,500.00
RAIL, UPPER LEFT
MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS
19 | 365A08-8639-0951 . NO BID
RAIL, UPPER LEFT
20 365A08-8639-11 FN 1EA 15 Days $8,000.00000 EA $8,000.00
RAIL, MIDDLE LEFT
MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS
21 | 365A21-8209-20 - NO BID
RAIL, LOWER LH
1. Prime Industries' Standard Terms & Conditions of Sale apply. Delivery is quoted in Business Days only,
2. Prices & deliveries herein quoted are applicable to the quantities as covered by this quotation.
3. All materials quoted from stock or with deliveries of 15 days or less are subject to prior sale.
4. In the event of an order, the above commaodities are not to be shipped to any country that has an embargo
placed against it by the U.S. Government. Should these commaodities require an export license, it shall be .
your responsibilty to comply with the United States Department of State/Commerce Export Regulations. Continued on next page...
5. If an Export License is required, a $250.00 processing fee will apply for each occurrence
6. Hazardous Material (HAZMAT) Shipments shall be subject to a minimum Haz-Mat handling fee of $250.00 per package.
FN=Factory New/NS=New Surplus/OH=Overhaul Certified/SV=Serviceable/RP=Repaired/AR=As Removed

Copyright (c) PENTAGON 2000 Software, Inc.
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MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS
22 365A21-8209-21 . NO BID
RAIL, LOWER RH
MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS
23 ASNA2051DXJ4013 FN 100 EA 3 Days $0.50000 EA $50.00
* Quantity is greater than requested (4 ) *
RIVET,100? CSK
24 212177B3211 FN 100 EA 15 Days $0.40000 EA $40.00
* Quantity is greater than requested (4 ) *
RIVET
25 21217TB2400 FN 20 EA 7 Days $5.00000 EA $100.00
* Quantity is greater than requested (2 ) *
RIVET
26 365A08-8647-42 FN 1EA 15 Days $50.00000 EA $50.00
TEFLON SHIM
MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS
27 677-2-50-512 NS 1EA Stock $2,000.00000 EA $2,000.00
LOCK PIN KING
Trace To: Prime CoC
28 365A25-8099-00 | NO BID
VERROU PRE-CATCH G
MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS
29 EN2948-060 FN 50 EA 15 Days $1.50000 EA $75.00
* Quantity is greater than requested (3) *
RETAINER,NUT
30 23351A6080LE | NO BID
WASHER LOCK
31 365A33-6206-20 FN 2EA 15 Days $40.00000 EA $80.00
PLATE
32 365A33-6187-20 NS 1EA Stock $450.00000 EA $450.00
SHIM
MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS
33 365A33-6208-20 FN 5SEA 15 Days $25.00000 EA $125.00
WASHER,THICKNESS 3MM
1. Prime Industries' Standard Terms & Conditions of Sale apply. Delivery is quoted in Business Days only,
2. Prices & deliveries herein quoted are applicable to the quantities as covered by this quotation.
3. All materials quoted from stock or with deliveries of 15 days or less are subject to prior sale.
4. In the event of an order, the above commaodities are not to be shipped to any country that has an embargo
placed against it by the U.S. Government. Should these commaodities require an export license, it shall be .
your responsibilty to comply with the United States Department of State/Commerce Export Regulations. Continued on next page...
5. If an Export License is required, a $250.00 processing fee will apply for each occurrence
6. Hazardous Material (HAZMAT) Shipments shall be subject to a minimum Haz-Mat handling fee of $250.00 per package.
FN=Factory New/NS=New Surplus/OH=Overhaul Certified/SV=Serviceable/RP=Repaired/AR=As Removed

Copyright (c) PENTAGON 2000 Software, Inc.
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MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS
34 365A33-6208-21 FN 8 EA 15 Days $47.50000 EA $380.00
WASHER, THICKNESS 3MM
MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS
35 365A33-6212-20 FN 1EA 15 Days $145.00000 EA $145.00
WASHER ADJUSTMENT
MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS
36 365A33-6212-21 FN 1EA 15 Days $145.00000 EA $145.00
WASHER ADJUSTMENT
MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS
37 365A33-6212-22 FN 1EA 15 Days $150.00000 EA $ 150.00
WASHER ADJUSTMENT
MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS
38 365A33-6212-23 FN 1EA 15 Days $153.00000 EA $153.00
WASHER ADJUSTMENT
MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS
39 365A33-6212-24 FN 1EA 15 Days $ 155.00000 EA $ 155.00
WASHER ADJUSTMENT
MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS
40 365A33-6212-25 FN 1EA 15 Days $160.00000 EA $ 160.00
WASHER ADJUSTMENT
MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS
41 365A33-6212-26 FN 1EA 15 Days $163.00000 EA $163.00
WASHER ADJUSTMENT
MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS
42 365A33-6212-27 FN 1EA 15 Days $170.00000 EA $170.00
WASHER ADJUSTMENT
MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS
43 365A33-6212-28 FN 1EA 15 Days $170.00000 EA $170.00
WASHER ADJUSTMENT
MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS
44 365A33-6212-29 FN 1EA 15 Days $175.00000 EA $175.00
WASHER ADJUSTMENT
1. Prime Industries' Standard Terms & Conditions of Sale apply. Delivery is quoted in Business Days only,
2. Prices & deliveries herein quoted are applicable to the quantities as covered by this quotation.
3. All materials quoted from stock or with deliveries of 15 days or less are subject to prior sale.
4. In the event of an order, the above commaodities are not to be shipped to any country that has an embargo
placed against it by the U.S. Government. Should these commaodities require an export license, it shall be .
your responsibilty to comply with the United States Department of State/Commerce Export Regulations. Continued on next page...
5. If an Export License is required, a $250.00 processing fee will apply for each occurrence
6. Hazardous Material (HAZMAT) Shipments shall be subject to a minimum Haz-Mat handling fee of $250.00 per package.
FN=Factory New/NS=New Surplus/OH=Overhaul Certified/SV=Serviceable/RP=Repaired/AR=As Removed

Copyright (c) PENTAGON 2000 Software, Inc.
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MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS
45 365A33-6212-30 FN 1EA 15 Days $180.00000 EA $180.00
WASHER ADJUSTMENT
MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS
46 365A33-6212-31 FN 1EA | 15Days $180.00000 EA $180.00
WASHER ADJUSTMENT
MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS
47 365A33-6212-32 FN 1EA 15 Days $185.00000 EA $185.00
WASHER ADJUSTMENT
MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS
48 |365A33-6211-20 FN 1EA | Stock $100.00000 EA $100.00
WASHER ADJUSTMENT
MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS
49 365A33-6211-21 FN 1EA Stock $100.00000 EA $100.00
WASHER ADJUSTMENT
MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS
50 365A33-6211-22 FN 1EA Stock $100.00000 EA $100.00
WASHER ADJUSTMENT
MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS
51  |365A33-6211-23 FN 1EA | Stock $100.00000 EA $100.00
WASHER ADJUSTMENT
MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS
52 365A33-6211-24 FN 1EA Stock $100.00000 EA $100.00
WASHER ADJUSTMENT
MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS
53 365A33-6211-25 FN 1EA Stock $100.00000 EA $100.00
WASHER ADJUSTMENT
MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS
54 | 365A33-6211-26 FN 1EA | Stock $100.00000 EA $100.00
WASHER ADJUSTMENT
MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS
55 365A33-6211-27 FN 1EA Stock $100.00000 EA $100.00
WASHER ADJUSTMENT
1. Prime Industries' Standard Terms & Conditions of Sale apply. Delivery is quoted in Business Days only,
2. Prices & deliveries herein quoted are applicable to the quantities as covered by this quotation.
3. All materials quoted from stock or with deliveries of 15 days or less are subject to prior sale.
4. In the event of an order, the above commaodities are not to be shipped to any country that has an embargo
placed against it by the U.S. Government. Should these commaodities require an export license, it shall be .
your responsibilty to comply with the United States Department of State/Commerce Export Regulations. Continued on next page...
5. If an Export License is required, a $250.00 processing fee will apply for each occurrence
6. Hazardous Material (HAZMAT) Shipments shall be subject to a minimum Haz-Mat handling fee of $250.00 per package.
FN=Factory New/NS=New Surplus/OH=Overhaul Certified/SV=Serviceable/RP=Repaired/AR=As Removed

Copyright (c) PENTAGON 2000 Software, Inc.
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MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS
56 365A33-6211-28 FN 1EA Stock $100.00000 EA $100.00
WASHER ADJUSTMENT
MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS
57 365A33-6211-29 FN 1EA Stock $100.00000 EA $100.00
WASHER ADJUSTMENT
MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS
58 365A33-6211-30 FN 1EA Stock $100.00000 EA $100.00
WASHER
MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS
59 |365A33-6211-31 FN 1EA | Stock $100.00000 EA $100.00
WASHER ADJUSTMENT
MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS
60 365A33-6210-20 FN 1EA Stock $300.00000 EA $300.00
BUSHING
MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS
61 365A33-6210-21 FN 1EA Stock $245.00000 EA $245.00
BUSHING
MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS
62 365A33-6210-22 FN 1EA Stock $245.00000 EA $245.00
BUSHING
MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS
63 365A33-6210-23 FN 1EA Stock $245.00000 EA $245.00
BUSHING
MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS
64 365A33-6210-24 FN 1EA Stock $245.00000 EA $245.00
BUSHING
MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS
65 365A33-6180-30 FN 1EA Stock $300.00000 EA $300.00
WASHER
MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS
66 365A33-6180-31 FN 1EA Stock $300.00000 EA $300.00
WASHER
1. Prime Industries' Standard Terms & Conditions of Sale apply. Delivery is quoted in Business Days only,
2. Prices & deliveries herein quoted are applicable to the quantities as covered by this quotation.
3. All materials quoted from stock or with deliveries of 15 days or less are subject to prior sale.
4. In the event of an order, the above commaodities are not to be shipped to any country that has an embargo
placed against it by the U.S. Government. Should these commaodities require an export license, it shall be .
your responsibilty to comply with the United States Department of State/Commerce Export Regulations. Continued on next page...
5. If an Export License is required, a $250.00 processing fee will apply for each occurrence
6. Hazardous Material (HAZMAT) Shipments shall be subject to a minimum Haz-Mat handling fee of $250.00 per package.
FN=Factory New/NS=New Surplus/OH=Overhaul Certified/SV=Serviceable/RP=Repaired/AR=As Removed

Copyright (c) PENTAGON 2000 Software, Inc.
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MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS
67 | 365A33-6180-32 FN 1EA |Stock $300.00000 EA $300.00
WASHER
MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS
68 365A33-6180-33 FN 1EA | Stock $300.00000 EA $300.00
WASHER
MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS
69 365A33-6180-34 FN 1EA Stock $300.00000 EA $300.00
WASHER
MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS
70 | 365A33-6180-35 NS 1EA |Stock $200.00000 EA $200.00
WASHER
Trace To: Prime coC
MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS
71 365A33-6180-36 NS 1EA | Stock $350.00000 EA $350.00
WASHER
Trace To: Prime CoC
MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS
72 |365A33-6180-37 FN 1EA |Stock $350.00000 EA $350.00
WASHER
MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS
73 365A33-6180-38 FN 1EA Stock $350.00000 EA $350.00
WASHER
MFG: (F0210) AIRBUS HELICOPTERS
74 21217DB1612 FN 100 EA 15 Days $0.50000 EA $50.00
* Quantity is greater than requested (2) *
RIVET
75 ECS2334BE100M FN 5EA 15 Days $7.50000 EA $37.50
* Quantity is greater than requested (1) *
NUT
I/W: 22542K100
76 | 23350AC100LE FN 20EA |15 Days $3.50000 EA $70.00
* Quantity‘is greater than requ‘ested (1)*
1. Prime Industries' Standard Terms & Conditions of Sale apply. Delivery is quoted in Business Days only,
2. Prices & deliveries herein quoted are applicable to the quantities as covered by this quotation.
3. All materials quoted from stock or with deliveries of 15 days or less are subject to prior sale.
4. In the event of an order, the above commaodities are not to be shipped to any country that has an embargo
placed against it by the U.S. Government. Should these commaodities require an export license, it shall be .
your responsibilty to comply with the United States Department of State/Commerce Export Regulations. Continued on next page...
5. If an Export License is required, a $250.00 processing fee will apply for each occurrence
6. Hazardous Material (HAZMAT) Shipments shall be subject to a minimum Haz-Mat handling fee of $250.00 per package.
FN=Factory New/NS=New Surplus/OH=Overhaul Certified/SV=Serviceable/RP=Repaired/AR=As Removed

Copyright (c) PENTAGON 2000 Software, Inc.
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WASHER
77 23310LA015015 | NO BID
COTTER PIN
78 218040710 FN 1EA 15 Days $55.00000 EA $55.00
ORING
79 MS28778-6 FN 50 EA Stock $1.00000 EA $50.00
* Quantity is greater than requested (2) *
PACKING
80 DH5621-100.03 FN 10 EA 15 Days $ 14.50000 EA $ 145.00
* Quantity is greater than requested (2 ) *
O-RING
EXPORT COMPLIANCE STATEMENT
Products sold by PRIME INDUSTRIES, INC. may require @ license from the U.S. Department of State,

the U.S. Department of Commerce, or the U.S. Dep
out of the United States. PRIME INDUSTRIES, INC
United States Export Control Regulations including
in Arms Regulations (ITAR), the Export Administrati
Assets Control (OFAC), and the Foreign Corrupt Pr
of products requiring a license from the U.S. Depart
and/or the U.S. Department of Treasury is strictly pr
correspondence may contain technical data that is g
Traffic in Arms Regulations (ITAR) and/or the Expor,
proper approval from the U.S. Department of State
or release of this technical data to a foreign person
United States or abroad, is strictly prohibited.
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1. Prime Industries' Standard Terms & Conditions of Sale apply. Delivery is quoted in Business Days only,
2. Prices & deliveries herein quoted are applicable to the quantities as covered by this quotation.
3. All materials quoted from stock or with deliveries of 15 days or less are subject to prior sale.
4. In the event of an order, the above commaodities are not to be shipped to any country that has an embargo
placed against it by the U.S. Government. Should these commaodities require an export license, it shall be
your responsibilty to comply with the United States Department of State/Commerce Export Regulations.
5. If an Export License is required, a $250.00 processing fee will apply for each occurrence
6. Hazardous Material (HAZMAT) Shipments shall be subject to a minimum Haz-Mat handling fee of $250.00 per package.
FN=Factory New/NS=New Surplus/OH=Overhaul Certified/SV=Serviceable/RP=Repaired/AR=As Removed

Continued on next page...

Copyright (c) PENTAGON 2000 Software, Inc.
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Line P/N & Description Cnd Qty Bid Delivery

Unit Price

Amount

Sub Total:

$ 33,068.50

1. Prime Industries' Standard Terms & Conditions of Sale apply. Delivery is quoted in Business Days only,

2. Prices & deliveries herein quoted are applicable to the quantities as covered by this quotation.

3. All materials quoted from stock or with deliveries of 15 days or less are subject to prior sale.

4. In the event of an order, the above commaodities are not to be shipped to any country that has an embargo

placed against it by the U.S. Government. Should these commaodities require an export license, it shall be
your responsibilty to comply with the United States Department of State/Commerce Export Regulations.

5. If an Export License is required, a $250.00 processing fee will apply for each occurrence
6. Hazardous Material (HAZMAT) Shipments shall be subject to a minimum Haz-Mat handling fee of $250.00 per package.

FN=Factory New/NS=New Surplus/OH=Overhaul Certified/SV=Serviceable/RP=Repaired/AR=As Removed

Total:  [USD]

$ 33,068.50
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